
Ordinance No. 706, N.S. 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF EL PAS0 DE ROBLES, 
AMENDING TITLE 17 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE; 

BUILDTNG AND CONSTRUCTION. 

Be it ordained by the City Council of the City of El Paso de Robles, that the following 
amendments to the 1994 Editions of the Uniform Codes, and the 1993 National Electrical Code 

f are hereby adopted. 

Chapter 17.04 of the Paso Robles Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
a@ 

17.04.020 CHANGES OR ADDITIONS TO THE UNIFORM BUILDING CODE 

A. Building Site Grading: 

1. All building sites must be graded to drain roof and surface waters to nearest approved 
place to deposit such waters, such as street, storm drain or natural watercourse. 
Adequate provisions shall be made to prevent drainage waters from damaging the cut 
face of an excavation or the slope face of a fill, or any other portion of the building 
site, lot or adjoining properties. 

Proposed site grading andlor required plot plans must be approved by the Public Works 
Department with the actual site work completed and accepted by the City Engineer or 
his authorized representative prior to issuance of the building permit. Issuance of 
building permits prior to completion of the site work will be subject to planning 
commission approval. Requests for exemption shall be submitted through the office of 
the City Engineer, subject to his review and recommendation. 

f 
2. There shall be a minimum of five feet unobstructed area in each side yard of any 

residential building. In the front and rear yards, a minimum of ten feet of usable, 
unobstructed, natural or constructed area shall be required. 

' & 

B. Section 104 Start of Construction, is amended as follows: 

104.2.1.1 Start of Construction: 

For the purpose of enforcement of this code, it shall be interpreted that any movement 
of soil or preparation for installation of foundation or utilities, other than that allowed 
under the jurisdiction of an approved grading permit, shall signify the start of 
construction. Prior to start of construction, a valid building permit shall be secured. 

C. Section 105 Board of Appeals 

105.1 Board of Housing and Disabled Access Appeals established. 

In order to provide for interpretations of steps necessary to implement the Uniform 
Housing Code, Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, Title 24 of the 
California Code of Regulations or the technical codes adopted by the Chapter pertaining 
to access or accommodations for the physically disabled, and those Chapters of 
Municipal Code where the Board is specifically noted as being the entity responsible 
for the hearing of appeals, there is hereby established a City of Paso Robles Housing 
Advisory and Disabled Access Board of Appeals, (hereinafter sometimes collectively 
referred to as "Board of Appeals" or "Board"). 

The Board shall serve as the "local appeals board" specified in sections 19957.5 of the 
California Health and Safety Code, in appeals relating to accommodations for the 
physically disabled. 

Other:. 



105.2 Responsibilities and Limitation of Authority. 

The Board of Appeals shall function as the "Local Appeals Board" and "Housing 
Appeals Board" and "Disabled Appeals Board" as specified in Sections 17920.5 and 
17920.6, respectively, of Division 13, Part 1.5 of the California Health and Safety Code. 
The Board shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative 
provisions of the codes adopted by the City, nor shall the Board be empowered to 
waive requirements of any code adopted by the City. 

The authority of the Board shall consist of the ability to consider appeals filed pursuant 
to this Chapter and give reasonable interpretations of the Chapter and the technical 
codes. When required to do so, the Board will conduct hearings regarding appeals of 
notices and/or orders relative to unsafe buildings pursuant to the Uniform Code for the 
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings and substandard buildings pursuant to the Uniform 
Housing Code adopted by reference in Chapter 17.04. 

105.3 Membership. 

Board of Appeals. The Housing Advisory and Board of Appeals (hereinafter sometimes 
referred to as "Board of Housing Appeals") shall consist of five (5) members; the 
Disabled Access Board of Appeals shall consist of the five (5) members of the Board 
of Housing Appeals and shall be supplemented by two (2) additional members, both of 
whom shall be physically disabled as defined in section 2-417, Title 24, Part 2 of the 
California Code of Regulations when the appeal pertains to disabled access. 

Members selected to hear an appeal shall reflect an area of expertise reflective of the 
appeal being heard. 

Members of the Board of Appeals shall be qualified by experience and training to pass 
judgment upon matters pertaining to building construction and/or disabled access, as 
appropriate. Members of the Board of Appeals shall be appointed by, and serve at the 
pleasure of the City Council. Each member of the Board shall comply with applicable 
provisions of the Political Reform Act of 1974, California Government Code Section 
81000 et seq. The Building Official shall be an ex officio member of the Board and 
shall act as secretary to said Board, but shall have no vote upon any matter before the 
Board. 

105.4 Eligibility. 

Any individual meeting that criteria as set forth in sub-section 105.3 above shall be 
eligible to serve on the Board of Appeals. 

Exception: 

Employees of the City shall not be eligible to serve on the Board of Appeals. 

105.5 Term. 

Terms of initial appointment shall be for a term of two (2) years for two (2) members 
and four (4) years for three (3) members. Subsequent appointments shall be for a term 
of four (4) years. 

Terms for initial appointment of disabled members for the Disabled Access Appeals 
shall be two (2) years for one member and four (4) years for the second. Subsequent 
appointments shall be for a term of four (4) years. 



105.6 Rules and Regulations. 

The Board of Appeals shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations, subject to approval 
by the City Council, for conducting its business. The Board Shall render all decisions 
in writing. 

105.7 Appeals Procedure. 

Any person aggrieved by a decision of the Building Official for the City pertaining to 
orders, decisions, or determinations relative to the application and interpretations of the 
Uniform Housing Code, Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, Title 
24 of the California Code of Regulations or the technical codes adopted by the Chapter 
pertaining to access or accommodations for the physically disabled, shall have the right 
to appeal the decision as provided for under this chapter. 

Decisions and actions regarding the enforcement of the requirements of Division 13, 
Part 5.5 of the California Health and Safety Code may be appealed by any person to 
the Appeals Board for Disabled Access as provided for under this chapter. 

105.8 Appeal Hearing Fee. 

A fee, as provided for under this sub-section, shall accompany an application for a 
hearing before any Housing Advisory or Board of Appeals. The purpose of the fee shall 
be to cover those costs incurred by the City to provide for the appeals process. 

Appeal Fees shall be set by resolution, subject to review by City Council. Appeal fees 
will be reviewed periodically to ensure that the fees charged cover the costs associated 
with the appeals process. 

105.9 Timing and form of appeal. 

An appeal shall be filed with the Secretary of the Board of Appeals or Appeals Board 
for Disabled Access (as applicable) within fifteen (1 5) working days (holidays observed 
by the City are not working days) after the rendering of the decision affecting the 
aggrieved person. Grounds for the appeal shall be set forth in writing in a form to be 
supplied by the secretary in addition to any other supporting materials the appellant may 
wish to furnish, setting forth the reasons for the appeal. 

Any written reports to be made to the Board shall be filed with the Secretary of the 
Board and shall be made available to the Board and to the public no less than five (5) 
working days prior to the date set for the hearing. Any City of Paso Robles Department 
Manager or designee shall have the right to be heard on any matter coming before the 
Board. 

105.10 Hearing and decision. 

The Secretary of the Board shall set the time and place for a hearing the appeal, and 
a notice of the time and place of the hearing shall be published in a newspaper of 
general circulation in the City of Paso Robles, and notice shall also be given to the 
appellant by mailing, postage prepaid, at the address provided by the appellant in the 
letter of appeal at least ten (10) working days before the hearing date. 

D. Section 106.4 is amended and subsection 106.4.5.1 is added to Section 106.4, Permit 
Issuance: 

106.4.5.1 Permit Issuance: 

Should a permit be secured by check, later to be returned for insufficient 
funds or closed account, that this shall show just cause for revocation of any 



permits and posting of a Stop Work Order. In conjunction with posting of a Stop 
Work Order, the site shall be noticed for abatement. 

106.4.5.2 Street Dedication as a Condition of Issuance of a Building Permit: 

No Building Permit shall be issued for the construction, reconstruction or 
relocation of any building or structure abutting upon a street having a lesser 
width than that established by resolution of the City Council unless the 
following requirements are complied with: 

106.4.5.3 Dedication of Street Right-of-way: 

When the building permit valuation is $15,000.00 or more, as measured for the 
cumulative valuation of permits over any five (5) year period, the owner of the 
lot shall make a formal and irrevocable offer of dedication to the City for public 
street purposes, and all uses appurtenant thereto, of a depth equal to one-half of 
the width of the street(s) described in the resolution. It shall be the responsibili- 
ty of the City Engineer to confirm that the required dedication(s) hashave been 
provided. 

106.4.5.4 Setbacks: 

The required setback shall be maintained for all buildings, structures and 
improvements, including off-street parking, as measured from the right-of-way 
width. It shall be the responsibility of the Building Official to confirm that the 
required setbacks have been provided, based on property monuments established 
by a licensed surveyor. 

E. Section 108 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows: 

An inspection may be refused if: 

108.4.1 The project address is not conspicuously posted on site. 

108.4.2 A trash container or enclosure capable of retaining debris associated with 
construction process is not available on site, or an existing container is not 
regularly emptied or maintained. 

108.4.3 Portable sanitary facilities are not located within reasonable walking distance of 
the site (75 yards). There shall be not less than one approved type of water 
closet for each twenty (20) employees or a fractional part thereof, at start of 
construction. 

F. Permit Fees, Table 1-A is hereby deleted 

G. Section 109 Certificate of Occupancy, of the Uniform Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

109.1 No building hereafter erected, moved, enlarged or altered shall be occupied, used 
or changed in use until after final inspection of such building has been 
performed and a Certificate of Occupancy shall have been applied for coincident 
with the application for a building permit. 

109.1.1 A Certificate of Occupancy shall be issued only after such building, enlargement 
or alteration has been completed in conformity with the provisions of this and 
all other codes and/or required conditions established by the City. 



109.1.2 The exception will be those buildings given prior administrative approval to be 
erected and used as models of typical construction in conformity with 109.1 
above. Upon administrative approval utilities could be established. The 
required Certificate of Occupancy will be deferred until such time as a request 
for permanent occupancy is made. 

109.1.3 Any use legally occupying an existing building at the time this code becomes 
effective may be continued but shall not be changed unless a Certificate of 
Occupancy for the new use shall have been issued by the Building Division, 
pending review by the Community Development Department and after finding 
that such use conforms to this and all other applicable codes or required 
conditions. 

H. Guardrail - Section 509.1 is amended as follows:. 

Man-made changes in grade such as retaining walls, garden walls, abrupt changes in 
elevation in excess of 30 inches, sloped grades in excess of one ( I )  foot vertical to two 
feet horizontal, or other gradient conditions, which in the opinion of City Health and 
Safety Officials, may constitute potential hazard should they be left accessible to the 
public, shall be protected by a suitable fence or guardrail, meeting those height and 
spacing requirements as noted in Uniform Building Code Table 16-B. 

Exceptions to the above: 

509.1.1 Landscape or garden terracing, rendered non-accessible to the a public by the 
means of existing perimeter fencing or when protected by the landscape 
elements (Example: hedge rows). 

509.1.2 Topographical or Geographical conditions inherent to the property, lying outside 
that area normally frequented by individuals. 

I. Section 2311.7 Truss Connection, is added as follows: 

Truss connection to plate shall be made by the use of a visible mechanical connector 
designed expressly for that purpose satisfying all loading requirements. Standard roof 
rafters found in conventional construction shall be attached in the same manner.Trusses 
in excess of 35 feet shall be ridge blocked to eliminate the deflection or bending which 
would effect loading. 

J. Section 708.2.1 (5), Fire and Draft Stops, is amended as follows: 

708.2.1 Fire Stops, where required. Firestopping shall be provided in the following 
locations: 

(5) In openings around vents, pipes, ducts, chimneys, fireplaces and similar 
openings which afford a passage for fire at ceiling and floor levels, with 
noncombustible materials. In addition to those requirements outlined under this 
Section, wood burning appliances shall be provided with a one-hour fire rated 
chase surrounding the flue, when such appliances penetrate any part of the attic 
space. 

K. Chapter 11, Accessibility. Add Section 1101.3 as Follows: 

1101.3 Maintenance. All buildings, structures, and sites, both existing and new, and all 
parts thereof, including parking, facilities and equipment for the physically 
disabled, shall be maintained in a safe, functionally effective and sanitary 
condition. All devices or safeguards which are required by this code shall be 
maintained in conformance with the Code Edition, State, or Federal Regulations 
under which they were installed. 



Regrading, repaving, replacement of signage and/or restriping of physically 
disabled parking spaces in parking lots and structures in both publicly and 
privately funded public or commercial facilities shall comply with the State of 
California Code of Regulations of the California Building Code adopted on July 
19, 1989. 

L. Section 1924 Wire Mesh - Floor Slab, of the Uniform Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

The minimum thickness of concrete floors and slabs supported directly on the 
ground shall be not less than 3% " (89 mm). 

Where concrete slab floor on grade construction is used and slabs are not poured 
monolithic with footings there shall be placed vertically in all perimeter footings 
three eights (318) inch deformed steel reinforcing bars, spaced four (4) feet 
center to center. The bars shall be wired in place at time of foundation 
inspection, not wet set in conjunction with the concrete pour. Said bars shall be 
bent inward and tied to the six by six (6 x 6) - tedten (10110) wire mesh slab 
reinforcing prior to pouring the slab. Vapor barriers shall not extend over the 
bearing surface of the perimeter footings or stem wall. When floor slabs and 
footings are poured monolithic, the three eights (3/8) inch diameter vertical 
reinforcing may be omitted. All building slabs shall have a minimum six by six 
(6 x 6) - tenlten (10110) wire mesh reinforcing. Fill material in trenches and 
under slabs shall be sand unless native material is approved by the Building 
Official. 

M. Section 1806.5 Footings is amended as follows: 

1806.5.1 All continuous concrete or masonry foundations shall be reinforced with not less 
than two (2) each - Number four (4) reinforcing bars. 

r 
1806.5.2 Any footing or stem wall obtaining a height of 30" or more may be required to 

'ri have additional horizontal reinforcing. 

1806.5.3 There shall be no stacking of concrete for piers or stem walls. All stem walls 
shall be formed on both sides (inside and out). 

1806.5.4 Any anchorage other than standard foundation bolts required by building design 
or calculation shall be secured in place at the time of foundation inspection. 

N. Section 1507.12 Wood Shakes, is amended as follows: 

Installation of wood shingles or shakes, chemically treated to be fire retardant, when 
used in new construction, or when re-roofing, shall meet that installation criteria as 
outlined in Uniform Building Code Section 1504.1.1 and 1504.5.2. 

0. Section 304.7 is amended as follows: 

Group B occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all structures 
classed as Group B occupancies where the floor area exceeds 5000 square feet on all 
floors or in Group B occupancies 3 stories or more. The area of mezzanines shall be 
included in determining the areas where sprinklers are required. This requirement shall 
not preclude the installation of any separation walls required by other sections of the 
Building Code. 



P. Section 904.2.1, Fire Extingishing Systems, Where Required. 

I. New Construction: 

Unless required by the Uniform Building Code for a lesser square footage, an automatic 
sprinkler system shall be installed in all structures where the total floor area exceeds 
5000 square feet. The area of mezzanines, and additional stories above the ground floor, 
shall be included in determining the areas where sprinklers are required. This require- 
ment shall not preclude the installation of any separation walls required by other 
sections of the Building Code. 

t -  Exception: Group R - Divisions I and I11 Occupancies, unless required by Section 
1003.2 of the Uniform Fire Code. 

The square footage of a building shall be computed using a combination of both usable 
and unusable floor area. Vent shafts and concealed spaces shall be considered when 
computing building area. Areas of buildings may not be reduced, subdivided, or 
compartmentalized into areas less than 5000 square feet by the installation of separation 
walls. Courts meeting the requirements of Section 503.3 of the Uniform Building Code 
shall not be included in the calculation. 

Plans for Fire Sprinkler systems shall be submitted for review prior to inspection of the 
structural frame. 

11. Existing Construction: 

An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all rooms or buildings, when the 
following conditions are determined to exist: 

1. In conjunction with any change in the occupancy group assigned the structure 
under the Uniform Building Code, and the floor area exceeds 5000 square feet. 

2. The area of mezzanines shall be included in determining the areas where 
sprinklers are required. This requirement shall not preclude the installation of 
any separation walls required by other sections of the Building Code. 

3. The square footage of a building shall be computed using inside wall areas. Vent 
shafts and concealed spaces shall be considered when computing building area. 
Areas of buildings may not be reduced, subdivided, or compartmentalized into 
areas less than 5000 square feet by the installation of separation walls. Courts 
meeting the requirements of Section 404 of the Uniform Building Codes shall 
not be included in the calculation. 

111. Historical Structures: 

The title "Historical Structure1' shall refer to those structures officially listed in the State 
Historical Register or the local historical inventory on file in the Community Development 
Department. 

The requirements to install an automatic fire sprinkler system in an Historical Structure 
shall be the same as those for an existing structure, except for the following provisions: 

Special conditions associated with Historical Structures: 

1. Recommendations for the placement of backflow devices and Fire Department 
connections on the exterior of a Historical Structure, shall be made by the Fire 
Department. The Fire Department's recommendations shall be subject to review 
by the City Planning Division, and the Development Review Committee. 



2. Exterior devices shall be installed in a manner as to prevent disruption of the 
historical aesthetics of the structure. 

3. Unless rendered impossible by structural components, sprinkler piping shall be 
installed within attic spaces, with the risers stubbed into the habitable area. In 
all cases, the system shall be designed and installed in a manner as to prevent 
disruption of any historical facades or architecture. 

r Q. Section 904.2.3.3, Exhibition and Display Rooms, is hereby deleted: 

R. Section 3103, Moved and Temporary Buildings, is amended as follows: 
@ 

3103.1 Buildings of Structures moved into, previously existing within, or assembled 
within the jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of this code for new 
buildings or structures. 

3103.2 Temporary buildings or structures such as reviewing stands and other 
miscellaneous structures, sheds, canopies, private aircraft hangers less than 900 
square feet in net area, or fences used for the protection of the public around 
and in conjunction with construction work may be erected by approval of a 
building permit from the Building Official that is valid for only a limited period 
of time. Said limited time period is to be ninety (90) days. Any extensions of 
that time period must be approved by City Council. All other buildings shall be 
termed as "permanent" buildings and required to meet all applicable codes. 

Temporary structures need not comply with the type of construction or fire - 
resistive time periods required by this code. Temporary buildings or structures 
shall be completely removed upon the expiration of the time period specified in 
the permit. Failure to remove the buildings or structures will result in abatement 
proceedings and misdemeanor citation as prescribed under Municipal Code. 

' d 
(Ord. 550 1988) 

S. Section 3206 Awnings, of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows: 

3206.2 Awning Construction. 

Awnings shall have non-combustible frames. Awning frames may be rigid, except when 
in the opinion of the Fire Chief, emergency access to upper floors will be impeded by 
the installation of rigid frame awnings. Should this be the case, awnings shall be 
collapsible, retractable or capable of being folded against the face of the supporting 
building. When collapsed, retracted or folded, the design shall be such that the awning 
does not block any required exit. 

Coverings for all exterior awnings connected or adjacent to buildings shall be made 
either from fabric that has been made flame-resistant through treatment with an 
approved exterior chemical process by an approved application concern, or from 
inherently flame-resistance fabric approved and listed by the State Fire Marshal for 
exterior use. Certificates of flame-resistance or other documentation acceptable to the 
Chief shall be available on the premises (Exception: Single-family and small two-family 

f dwellings not exceeding 2 stories in height). 

T. Appendix Chapter 31, is amended as follows: 
1- 

3116.1 A patio, when enclosed through the use of insect screening or plastic which is 
readily removable, not exceeding 0.125 inch in thickness, shall be assumed to 
become an addition to the existing structure. 

3116.2 As an addition to the structure it shall adhere to those setback requirements as 



established by the currently adopted zoning regulations as they may pertain to 
the particular use, type of construction, or established zoning. 

(Ord. 581 N.S. (part), 1989:Ord. 550 N.S., 1988; Ord. 546 N.S., 1988; Ord. 538 N.S.8 1, 1987; 
Ord. 525 N.S. 8 1, 1987; Ord. 515 N.S. § 2, 1986) 

17.04.030 CHANGES OR ADDITIONS TO THE UNIFORM FIRE CODE 

ARTICLE 2. Definitions and Abbreviation. 

Section 204-6, is amended as follows: 

"Confined Area" shall mean any area bordered or surrounded by a wall, fence, planter, 
landscaping, or geography that would require the climbing or scaling of such to reach a public 
way. 

ARTICLE 9, Fire Department Access and Water Supply. 

A. Section 902, Fire Apparatus Access Roads. 

Uniform Fire Code Section 902.2 is amended as follows: 

902.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus roads shall be designed and maintained to support 
the imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be provided with a surface so as 
to provide all-weather driving capabilities. During the construction phase, this 
surface shall consist of base material with sufficient depth to support a 40,000 
lb. vehicle (a maintained depth of 6 inches of Class I1 base). 

902.2.2 Surface. Fire apparatus roads shall be designed and maintained to support the 
imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be provided with a surface so as to 
provide all-weather driving capabilities. During the construction phase, this 
surface shall consist of base material with sufficient depth to support a 40,000 
lb. vehicle (a maintained depth of 6 inches of Class I1 Base). 

902.2.3 Prior to occupancy, a fire apparatus road shall be made to conform to the 
requirements contained within the City Zoning Codes. 

902.2.4 When required, secondary means of access or apparatus roads not covered by 
Section 2, sub-sections 902.2.1 through 902.2.3 above, shall be developed and 
maintained per those specifications as established under Uniform Fire Code 
Section 902.2.2.1 through 902.2.2.6 

902.2.2.6 Any exceptions to this Ordinance will require the submittal of such improvement 
drawings and cross sections as necessary for the approval by the Director of 
Public Works and the Fire Chief. 

B. Section 901, Fire Department Access and Water Supply. 

Section 901.4.4 is amended as follows: 

901.4.4 Premises Identification. Approved numbers of addresses shall be placed on all 
new buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from street 
or road fronting the property. Said numbers shall contrast with their back- 
ground. The characters should be a minimum of 4 inches high with 112 inch 
stroke for single-family residences and minimum of 6 inches high with a 314 
inch stroke for all other occupancies. 

When the building or group of buildings (five units or more) is served by an 
alley or interior driveway, the numbers or alphabetical designation shall be 



displayed on a directory or annunciator board, approved by the Fire Chief, at 
each driveway or alley entrance. Senior Housing, Retirement Villas, Hotel and 
Motel annunciator boards shall be of a Graphic type. The property owner, 
Homeowner's Association or individual in charge of the property shall be 
responsible for maintaining the directory. 

C. ARTICLE 10, Fire Protection System and Equipment. 

Section 1001.1 is amended as follows: 

1001.1.1 Type Required. The chief shall designate the type and number of fire appliances 
to be installed and maintained in and upon all buildings and premises in the 
jurisdiction other than private dwellings. This shall be done according to the 
relative severity of probable fire, including the rapidity with which it may 
spread. Such appliances shall be of a type suitable for the probable class of fire 
associated with such building or premises and shall have approval of the chief. 
Portable fire extinguishers shall be in accordance with U.F.C. Standard No. 10- 1. 
The minimum fire extinguisher requirement shall be one (1) 2AlOBC fire 
extinguisher for every 75' of floor travel. 

Section 1003.2, Required Installations. 

I. New Construction: 

1. Unless required by the Uniform Building Code for a lesser square footage, an 
automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all structures where the total 
combination of both usable and unusable floor area exceeds 5000 square feet. 
The area of mezzanines, and additional stories above the ground floor, shall be 
included in determining the areas where sprinklers are required. This require- 
ment shall not preclude the installation of any separation walls required by other 
sections of the Building Code. 

Exception: Group R - Divisions I and I11 Occupancies, unless required by Section 
1003.2.2 of the Uniform Fire Code. 

2. The square footage of a building shall be computed using a combination of both 
usable and unusable floor area. Vent shafts and concealed spaces shall be con- 
sidered when computing building area. Areas of buildings may not be reduced, 
subdivided, or compartmentalized into areas less than 5000 square feet by the 
installation of separation walls. Courts meeting the requirements of Section 
503.3 of the Uniform Building Codes shall not be included in the calculation. 

3. Plans for Fire Sprinkler systems shall be submitted for review prior to inspection 
of the structural frame. 

4. Occupancies within Commercial Zones, in which the type of tenant is not known 
at the time of building permit (Shell Buildings), shall have the sprinkler system 
hydraulically designed to a minimum standard of N.F.P.A. #13 Ordinary Hazard 
Group 111. 

5. Occupancies within Industrial or Manufacturing Zones, when the type of tenant 
is not known at the time of construction, shall have the sprinkler system 
hydraulically designed to a minimum standard N.F.P.A. hazard group, as 
determined by the Fire Chief. 



11. Existing Construction: 

An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all rooms or buildings, when the 
following conditions are determined to exist: 

1. In conjunction with any change in the occupancy group assigned the structure 
under the Uniform Building Code, and the floor area exceeds 5000 square feet. 

2. The area of mezzanines shall be included in determining the areas where 
sprinklers are required. This requirement shall not preclude the installation of 
any separation walls required by other sections of the Building Code. 

3. The square footage of a building shall be computed using inside wall areas. Vent 
shafts and concealed spaces shall be considered when computing building area. 
Areas of buildings may not be reduced, subdivided, or compartmentalized into 
areas less than 5000 square feet by the installation of separation walls. Courts 
meeting the requirements of Section 404 of the Uniform Building Codes shall 
not be included in the calculation. 

111. Historical Structures: 

The title "Historical Structure" shall refer to those structures officially listed in the State 
Historical Register or the local historical inventory on file in the Community Development 
Department. 

The requirements to install an automatic fire sprinkler system in an Historical Structure 
shall be the same as those for an existing structure, except for the following provisions: 

A. Special conditions associated with Historical Structures: 

1. Recommendations for the placement of backflow devices and Fire Department 
connections on the exterior of a Historical Structure, shall be made by the Fire 
Department. The Fire Department's recommendations shall be subject to review 
by the City Planner and the Architectural Review Committee. 

2. Exterior devices shall be installed in a manner as to prevent disruption of the 
historical aesthetics of the structure. 

3. Unless rendered impossible by structural components, sprinkler piping shall be 
installed within attic spaces, with the risers stubbed into the habitable area. In 
all cases, the system shall be designed and installed in a manner as to prevent 
disruption of any historical facades or architecture. 

Section 1003.2.9 is added as follows: 

1003.2.9.1 All Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all 
buildings, regardless of occupancy, in the following instance: 

All new buildings or structures thirty-two (32) feet above grade (as measured 
from the adjacent natural grade to the roof edge). In no case, shall any structure 
intended for human habitation exceed thirty-two (32) feet in height, until such 
time as suppression equipment designed for heights in excess of thirty-two (32) 
feet is available to the Fire Department. 

Exception: 

Existing buildings which exceed the 32 foot height limitation, may incorporate 
use of areas above thirty-two (32) feet, for human habitation, provided they meet 
or exceed all applicable codes adopted by the City, which may pertain to the 



type of construction or given use proposed. The City's Fire Department and 
Building Division shall be responsible for the review of the structure, and any 
related construction drawings to determine their compliance with the applicable 
codes adopted by the City. 

Section 1003.3.1 is amended as follows: 

1003.3.1.1 All automatic sprinkler systems shall be supervised by an approved central, 
proprietary or remote station service or a local alarm which will give an audible 
signal at a constantly attended location 

Exceptions: 

1. Isolated specialty systems such as paint spray booth or other small systems as 
approved by the Fire Chief, unless the entire occupancy is equipped with an 
automatic sprinkler system. 

2. Residential sprinkler systems for single family dwellings, duplexes, or triplexes 
under 5,000 square feet. 

Section 1006.2.1.1 and 1006.2.1.2 are added as follows: 

1006.2.1.1 Prior to the installation of any new hood extinguishing system, the contractor 
will submit the plans of the proposed installations to the Paso Robles Fire 
Department for approval. 

1006.2.2.2 Plans need not be sophisticated Engineer's drawings. However they shall be 
proportional, and contain an approximate line drawing of the system. The 
information required to be included on such drawings shall include: 

1. Make and model of the system. 
2. Site location of system and type of chemical used. 
3. Size of hood. 
4. Number, type and location of appliances covered. 
5. Number, type and location of nozzles. 
6. Number and location of heat detectors. 
7. Location and length of run of piping and conduit 
8. Type, size and location of gas shut-off valve. 

Plans are not required for modification of an existing system, provided that the 
modification is complete, a description of the modification will be submitted with the 
certification of inspection. 

Upon completion of installation of a new system, a systems test is required. The test 
shall be that which is commonly referred to as a "Balloon Test", or that which is 
recommended by the system manufacturer if a "Balloon Test" is not feasible. In any 
case, the test shall check the operation of the manual pull station, if installed, the 
mechanical pneumatic or electric energy shut-off valve, and the piping, distribution, and 
nozzle system. 

D. Section 1101.1.1, Building or Property Damaged by Fire. 

The owner, occupant or other person having under their control'any property, or 
materials on property, damaged by fire, when access by public is possible, shall secure 
the property either by boarding up all openings, fencing, barricading or other 
appropriate measures as directed by the Fire Chief within 48 hours of the incident. 

Within thirty (30) days after written notice to do so has been served, all debris and/or 
damaged materials shall be removed from the property or proof furnished that 



contractual arrangements have been made for demolition, replacement or repair of all 
fire damaged structures remaining on the property involved in the fire. 

Section 1203 add section 1203.1 as follows: . 
1203.1 Walkways. Walkways leading from required exits to public way shall be 

provided with an all-weather surface not less than 36 inches wide and have a 
clear height of not less than seven (7) feet. 

E. Article 11, General Provisions for Fire Safety, Division V is added to the Uniform Fire 
Code as follows: 

ARTICLE 11. General Fire-safety Precautions. 

Division V. Ignition Sources 

Section 11 12.1, Fire-retardant roof coverings. 

Fire-retardant roof coverings as defined under Section 1507.12 of the Uniform Building 
Code shall be installed on all newly construction buildings and upon re-roofing. 

Section 1112.2.5 is added as follows: 

Fire Resistive Construction. All exterior awnings connected or adjacent to buildings 
shall be made either from fabric which has been made flame-resistant through treatment 
with an approved exterior chemical process by an approved application concern or from 
inherently flame-resistant fabric approved and listed by the State Fire Marshall for 
exterior use. Certificates of flame resistant or other documentation acceptable to the 
chief shall be available on the premises. 

Exception: Single-family and small two-family dwellings not exceeding 2 stories in 
height. 

Section 7902.3.2. is amended by adding the following: 

Plans shall be submitted with each application for a permit to store more than 110 
gallons of liquids in drums or tanks. The plans shall indicate the methods of storage, 
quantities to be stored, distances from buildings and property lines, access ways, fire 
protection facilities and provisions for drainage and runoff. Storage shall be in 
accordance with approved plans. 

Section 7902.2.2.1, Restricted Locations, is amended as follows: 

Section 79.501. The storage of Class I and Class I1 liquids in above-ground tanks 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of 
district in which such storage is prohibited. 

Storage of flammable or combustible liquids in above-ground tanks, storage of 
flammable or combustible liquids in outside above-ground tanks is prohibited in all 
areas of the City, except those zoning districts where the use is permitted, subject to 
approval of a conditional use permit. 

Temporary above-ground storage for storage for purposes of tract and/or public works 
projects may be permitted subject to special permit issued by the Fire Marshall. 



F. ARTICLE 10. Fire Protection Systems and Equipment. 

Section 1001.4 and 1001.5, Maintenance and Testing. 

Fire alarm systems shall be maintained and tested in accordance with nationally 
recognized standards. 

Fire Alarms shall be tested in an annual basis by a licensed firm or contractor, with a 
record of the inspection posted on the premises in an accessible/readable location. The 
agency providing the inspection shall be responsible for providing the City Fire 
Department with a duplicate copy of the inspection record. 

P. add Section 1001.5.1.1, Audibility. 

Fire alarms shall be discernable throughout any building or structure protected by a fire 
alarm system, fire sprinkler system, fire suppression system or other required 
installation. Alarm systems shall also comply with those requirements set forth under 
Title 24, California State Accessibility Standards for the Disabled. 

G. PART VIII - Appendices 

The following appendices to the Uniform Fire Code are hereby deleted: 

Appendix I-B Life Safety Requirements for High Rise Buildings 

Appendix 1 -C Stairway Identification 

Appendix 11-C Marinas 

Appendix 11-D Rifle Ranges 

17.04.040 CHANGES OR ADDITIONS TO THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL 
CODE. 

Changes or additions to the National Electrical Code, referenced to in Section 17.04.010 of this 
chapter are as follows: 

A. All electric services shall have a single main disconnect to disconnect all conductors in 
a building. 

B. In all new construction and remodels involving fifty percent or more of the total square 
footage of the building, when the required disconnect is located within the building or 
in an area not readily accessible, an emergency disconnect shall be provided in a readily 
accessible location on the exterior of the building as designated by the fire chief. The 
disconnecting device shall be located within an approved security enclosure (such as a 
Knox Box) and a key provided the fire department. (Ord. 581 N.S. (part), 1989: Ord. 
545 N.S., 1988; Ord. 515 N.S. 5 4, 1986) 

17.04.050 CHANGES OR ADDITIONS TO THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE. 

Changes or additions to the Uniform Plumbing Code referred to in Section 17.04.010 of this 
chapter are as follows: 

Section 313.6 is amended, providing minimum standards for freeze protection. 

(f) No water, soil or waste pipe shall be installed or permitted outside of a building or 
in an exterior wall, unless where necessary, adequate provision is made to protect such pipe 
from freezing. Minimum Standards for freeze protection shall be as follows: 



(i) All overhead potable water piping, and any branch feed pipes located in outside 
walls shall be constructed of type "L" rigid copper. 

(ii) The minimum size for Service risers for structures shall be 1" in diameter. Materials 
to be used may be Schedule 80 PVC or type "L" copper pipe. 

(iii) Overhead potable water piping located in attic spaces and exterior walls shall be 
covered with insulation providing a minimum resistance factor of R-3 or greater. The 
R-3 insulation shall be in addition to any wall or attic insulation required by California 
Energy Standards. 

(iv) A dedicated 20 amp, 120 volt receptacle, capable of supporting the loads associated 
with commercially available heat tapes shall be located within five feet of any 
backflowlcheck valve assembly associated with a fire suppression system. 

(vi) Commercial and residential fire suppression systems shall be provided with an 
insulation cover providing a minimum resistance factor of R-3. The insulation used must 
be of a minimum Class I11 flame spread index, with a smoke density no greater than 
450. 

a Section 402.3, Minimum measures for water Conservation, is added as follows. 
-3 
00 a. In order to provide minimum water conservation measures in all new construction, 
a when installing any new bathroom, restroom or toilet facility, or when increasing the net square 

footage of any structure, materials and or fixtures complying with the following shall be used: 

1. Toilets requiring 1.6 gallons or less per flush. 

2. Shower heads limiting flows to 2.75 gallons or less per minute. 

3. Faucet Aerators or devices which will limit the flow of lavatory faucets to a 
maximum 2.75 gallons per minute. 

4. Equipment installed in automatic and coin operated car washes must be capable of 
recycling a minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the water required for their daily 
operation. 

A. Section 608.0 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows: 

608.2 Excessive Water Pressure. Where local water pressure is in excess of eighty (80) pounds 
per square inch (551.2kPa), an approved type pressure regulator preceded by an 
adequate strainer shall be installed and the pressure reduced to eighty (80) pounds per 
square inch (551.2kPa) or less. For potable water services up to and including one and 
one half (1%) inch (38.1 mm) regulators, provision shall be made to prevent pressure 
on the building side of the regulator from exceeding main supply pressure. Approved 
regulators with integral by-passes are acceptable. Each such regulator and strainer shall 
be accessibly located and shall have the strainer readily accessible for cleaning without 
removing the regulator or strainer body or disconnecting the supply piping. All pipe 
size determinations shall be based on eighty (80) percent of the reduced pressure. 

As a result of excessive water pressures found within the City of El Paso de Robles, 
pressure regulators complying with 608.2 above shall be installed on all new 
construction, and on all remodels consisting of changes to, or increases of the floor 
space in excess of 50% of the existing gross square footage 

B. Section 315.4, is amended as follows: 

Plumbing trenches under buildings or concrete work shall be backfilled with sand unless 
native material is approved by Administrative Authority. 



C. Section 411.0, is amended as follows: 

Plumbing Fixtures Required. Each building shall be provided with sanitary facilities of 
not less than the minimum facilities listed for various occupancies as given in Appendix 
C, of this 1994 Uniform Plumbing Code. 

(Ord. 581 N.S. (part), 1989: Ord. 515 N.S. 5 5, 1986) 

17.04.060 BUILDING PERMIT, ENERGY REVIEW AND DEMOLITION FEES. 

The City Council shall, by resolution, establish the fees to be charged and collected for 
the issuance of building permits for construction, electrical, mechanical, and plumbing work 
including plan review; for energy review; and for plan review and inspections of demolished 
structures. Any fees imposed by this section shall be a civil debt owing to the city from the 
owner of the property where the service is performed. (Ord. 628 N.S. (part), 1992: Ord. 615 
N.S., 1991) 

17.04.070 PENALTY FOR VIOLATION 

Any person who violates any of the provisions of this chapter, or fails to comply with 
any order made thereunder, or who builds in violation of any detailed statement of 
specifications or plans submitted and approved thereunder, or any certificate or permit issued 
thereunder, and from which no appeal has been taken or who fails to comply with such an 
order as affirmed or modified by the jurisdiction, within the time affixed herein, shall severally 
for each and every violation and noncompliance, respectively, be guilty of a misdemeanor. 
(Ord. 628 N.S. (part), 1992: Ord. 581 N.S. (part), 1989: Ord. 515 N.S. 1986) 

This amendment of Municipal Code Section 17.04 of the City of El Paso de Robles 
entitled An Ordinance of the City of El Paso de Robles, amending Chapter 17.04 of the 
Municipal Code, thereby amending the 1994 Editions of the Uniform Codes, 1993 
National Electrical Code, and specified support codes shall supersede all other ordinances 
or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith. 

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of the ordinance is, for any reason, 
held to invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not effect the validity or constitutionality 
of the remaining portions of the ordinance. The City Council for the City of Paso Robles 
hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause, 
or phrase hereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, 
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional. 

This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters 
established herein, are hereby adopted and shall take effect and be in full force and effect 30 
days after the date of its second reading and adoption. 



PASSED AND ADOPTED this 19th day of December, 1995 by the following roll 
call vote: 

AYES: Heggerty, Iversen, Macklin, Martin, Picanco 

NOES: None 

ABSENT: None 

ABSTAIN: None 



PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA, 
County of San Luis Obispo 

I am a citizen of the United States and a 
resident of the County aforesaid; I am over the 
age of eighteen years, and not a party to or 
interested in the above entitled matter. I am 
the principal clerk of the printer of the Paso 
Robles Country News, a newspaper of gen- 
eral circulation, printed and published weekly 
on Wednesday in Paso Robles, Calif., County 
of San Luis Obispo, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circu- 
lation by Decree entered in the Superior Court 
of San Luis Obispo County, State of Califor- 
nia, on March 11,1982, Case No. 56022, under 
the provisions of Chapter 1, Division 7, Title 1 
of the Government Code of the State of Cali- 
fornia, that the notice of which the annexed is 
a printed copy (set in type no smaller than 
nonpareil), has been published in each regu- 
lar and entire issue of said newspaper and not 
in any supplement thereof on the following 
days, to wit: 

- DATES RUN: 01-03-96 

all in the year 19 96 

I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury 
that the foregoing is true and correct 

Dated at . Paso Robles, CA 

Signature 

Proof of Publication of 

O r d .  706 N.S. 

SS. 

Ordinance No. 706, N.S. 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE cIn 

OF EL PAS0 DE ROBLES, 
AMENDING TITLE 17 OF THE 
MUNlClPAL CODE BUILDING 

AND CONSTRUCTION. - - - - - . - . . . 
Be it ordained by the City Council of 

the City of El Paso de Robles, that the 
follow~n amendments to the 1994 
~ d i t i o n  05 the Uniform Codes, and the 
1993 National Electrical Code are 
hereby ado ted 

Chapter r7.04 of the Paso Robles 
Municipal Code is hereby amended to 
read as follows: 

17.04.020 CHA.NGES OR ADDI- 
TIONS TO THE UNIFORM BUILD- 
ING CODE 

A I.'AII Buildin builc8ng Site sites Grading: must be graded 

to drain roof and surface waters to 
nearest approved place to deposit such 
waters, such as street, storm drain or 
natural watercourse. Adequate provi- 
sions shall be made to prevent drain- 
a ewaters fromdamaglng thecut face 07 an excavation or the slo face of a 
fill, or any other portion o c h e  build- 
in site, lot or adjoining properties. 

Froposed site grading and /or re- 
?ired ploglans must beapproved by 
t ePub ic orks Department with the 
actual site work completed and ac- 
cepted by the City Englneer or his au- 
thorized re resentative prior to issu- 
ance of the\uilding permit. Issuance 
of building permits prior to comple- 
tion of the site work will be subject to 
planning commission a roval. Re- 
quests for exemption shaprbe submit- 
ted through theofficeof thecity Engi- 
neer. sub~ect to his review and recom- 
menhatidn. 

2. There shall be a minimum of five 
feetunobshucted areaineach side ard 
ofany residential buildinp;. 1n thelont  

litiesand Lir 

.-..-I.. el.-I1 C 

on: 
ment of 
ted that 
~aration -- . .GI: 

and karyard,a minimumof ten feet of 
usable, unabshucted, natural or con- 
structed area shall be re uired. 

B. Section 104 Start of ?onstruction, 
is amended as follows: 

104.2.1.1 Start of Constructis 
For the pu ose of enforce 

this code, it x a l l  be interpre 
any movement of soil or prel 
for installation of foundation ur utrll- 

ties,other than that allowed under the 
jurisdiction of an approved grading 
permit, shall signify the start of con- 
struction. Prior to start of construc- 
tion, a valid building permit shall be 
secured. 

C. Section 105 Board of A 
105.1 Board of Housin an8f 

Access Appeals establi5ed. 
In order to provide for int~ 

tions of steps necessary to im lemenr 
the Uniform Housing Code, Eniform 
Code for Abatement of Dangerous 
Buildin s, Title 24 of the California 
Code o f ~ e ~ u l a t i o n s  or the technical 
codes adopted by thechapter pertain- 
ing to access or accommodat~ons for 
the physically disabled, and those 
Chaptersof Municipal Code where the 
Board isspecifically noted asbeing the 
entity res onsible for the hearing of 
a peals, i e r e  is hereby established a 5.f ~ a s o  ~ o b l e s  ~ o u s i n ~  Advisory 
an thsabled Access Board of Appeals, 

ereinaftersometimescollectivel re 
Ihrred to as "Board of ~ ~ ~ e a l s '  0; 
"Board"). 

The Board shall serve as the "local 
a eals board" s ecified in sections 
19857.5 of the ~a\fornia Health and 
Safety Code, in appeals relatin to ac 
commodations for the physicaay dis: 
abled. 

105.2Reswnsibi nitation 
of ~ u t h o r i '  

The ~oartdrbf A~~~~~~ Jllprr .unction 
as the "Local A peals Board" and 
"Housing ~ ~ ~ e a L  Board" and "Dis- 
abled Ap als Board" as s ecified in 
Sections &0.5 and 179.2t6, res ec- 
tivel , of Division 13, Part 1.5 orthe 
CaliLrnia HealthandSafetvCode.The 
Board shall have no authohy relative 
to interpretation of the administrative 

rovisions of thecodesadopted by the 
Fity, nor shall the board be empow- 
ered to waive re uirementsof any code 
adapted bv thesitv. 

TlieauKori of the Board shall con- 
sist of the abirty to consider ap eals 
filedpursuant to th i s~ha~terancf  
reasonable in terpretationsof the&!; 
ter and the technical codes. When re-' 
quired todoso, theBoard will conduct 
hearings regarding appeals of notices 
andlorordersrelative to unsafebu~ld- 
inrspursuant to the Uniform Code for 
the Abatement of Dangerous Build- 
ings and substandard buildings 
suant to the Uniform Housing 8% 
adooted bvreferenceincha~ter 17.04 

1d5.3 ~Gmbership. ' 
Board of Appeals. The Housing Ad. 

visorv and Board of A D W ~ ~ S  (herein- 
afteriometimes referr;d to as'"Board 
of Housing Appeals" shall consist ol 
five (5) members; the Disabled Access 
Board of Appeals shall consist of the 
five (5) members of the Board of Hous- 
ing Appealsand shallbesu plemented 
by hvo(2)additional memgers,both of 
whom shall be ph sicall disabled as 
defined insect ion~417 ,~t le24 .~art2  
of the California Code of Regulations 
when the appeal pertains to disabled 
access. 

Members selected to hear an ap a1 
shall reflect an area of ex ertise reg- 
tive of the appeal being leard. 

Members of the Board of Appeals 
shall be qualified by experience and 
training to pass judgment upon rnat- 
ters pertaininfi to building construc- 
tion and/or drsabled access, as appro- 
priate. Members of the Board of A p  
peals shall be appointed by, and serve 
at the pleasure of the C ~ t y  Council. 
Each member of the Board shall com- 
gly mth  applicable provisions of the 

olit~cal Re orm Act of 1974, Califor- 
nia Government Codesection BlODO et 
seq. The Building Official shall be an 
ex officio member of the Board and 
shall act assecretary tosaid Boa 
shall have no vote upon any 
before the Board. 

105.4 Elieibilitv. 

~rd,  but 
matter 

Any indzidual meetin that cntena 
asset forthinsub-section?05.3shallbe - - - -  

eligibl 
peals. 

Exec 
Em loyees of the City shall not be 

eligibye to serve on the Board of A p  
ueals. 

e to serve 01 

!@ion: . ~ 

n the Board 

- . .. 

c - - -  
105.5 Tenn. 
Terms of initial it shall 

befora termof t w ~ , ~ , , ~ . . . ~  .". two(2) 
members and four (4) years for three 
(3) members. Subsequent a point- 
ments shall be for a term of Pour (4) 
years. 

Terms for initial ap inhentof dis- 
abled members for Disabled Ac- 
cess Appeals shall be two (2) years for 
one member and four (4) years for the 
second. Subsequent appointments 
shall be for a term of four (4) years. 

105.6 Rules and Regulations. 
The Board of Ap eals shall ado t 

reasonable rules an8regulations, sug- 
ject to approval b the Ci Council 
for conduction itsZusinesstYIhe Board 
Shall render all decisions in writing. 

105.7 Appeals Procedure. 
Any 7r:wn aggieved by a decisior 

of the ulld~ng fficial or the Cit] 
pertaining to orders, decisions or de- 
terminations relative to the applica- 
tion and interpretations of the Uni- 
form Housing Code, Uniform Code 
for Abatement of Dan emus Build- 
ings, Title 24 of the ~aliyornia code of 
Regulations or the technical codes 
adopted by the chapter pertaining to 
access or accommodat~ons for the 
physicall disabled,shall havetheri ht 
to a pearthe decisions asprovided$or 
un&r this chapter. 

Derisions and actions regarding the 
enforcement of the requirements of 
Division 13,  Part 5.5 of the California 
Health and Safety Code may be a 
&led by any erson to the ~ ~ ~ e a %  

ard for ~isabred ~ c t e s s  as provided 
for under thischapter. . . 



rm.8 A ~ I  w.' ' 
A fee, as prov~ded ?or under this 

subsecticn, shall a .company an ap- 
pr~cation forahearingbeforeany Hous- 
Ing Advisory of Board of Appeals. The 
purpose of the fee shall be to cover 
thosecosts incurred by thecity topro- 
vide for the appeals rocess. 

Appeal Fees shall ge set by resolu- 
tion, subject toreview by City Council. 
A eals fees will be rev~ewed periodi- 
c a g  to ensure that the fees charged 
cover the costs associated w ~ t h  the 
ap eals mess. 

405.9 #king and form of appeal. 
An appeal shall be filed w ~ t h  the 

Secretary of the Board of A peals or 
Appeals Board for Disabled lccess (as 
applicable) within fifteen (15) work- 
ing days (holida s observed by the 
C ~ t y  are not wor%ng days) after the 
rendenn of the decision affecting the 
aggrieve% erson. Grounds for the 
appeal shalrbeset forth in writlng In a 
form to be supplied by the secretary in 
addition to any other supporting ma- 
terials the appellant may wish to fur- 
nish, setting orth the reasons for the 
ap eal 

I n y  k i t t e n  reports to be made to 
the Board shall be filed with the Secre- 
tary of the Board and shall be made 
available to theBoard and to the public 
noless thanflve(5) workingdayiprior 
tothedateset forthe hearrng.Any City 
of Paso Robles Department Manarer 
or designee shall 6ave the right toYbe 
heard on any mattercoming before the 
Board. 

105.10 Hearing and decision. 
The Secretam of the Board shall set 

the time and $ace for a hearing the 
a peal, and a notice of the time and 
raceof the hearin shall be published 

?n a newspaper o B  eneral circulation 
in the Ci of ~aso%obles, and notice 
shall alsoxe given to the-appellant b 
mailing, postage prepaid, at the adl 
dress provided by the appellant in the 
letterofappeal ateast ten (10) working 
da s before the hearing date. 8. Sectio;. 106.4 is amended and sub- 
section 106.4.5.1 is added to Section 
106.4, Permit Issuance: 

106.4.5.1 Permit Issuance: 
Should a permit besecured by check, 

later to be returned for insufficient 
funds orclosed account, that this shall 
show just cause for revocation of an 
grmi ts  and posting of a Stop ~ o r i  

rder. Inconjunction withpostingof a 
Stoo Work Order. the site shall be no- 
tic& for abatement. 

106.4.5.2 Street Dedication as a Con- 
ditionofIssuanceofa Building Permit: 

No Building Permit shall be issued 
for the constriction, reconstruction or 
relocation of anv buildine or structure 
abuttin upon street hgving a lesser 
width J a n  that established by resolu- 
tion of the Citv Council unless the fol- 
lowing re led 
with: 

106.4.5.3 ht- 
of-Way: 

When the building permit valuation 
is$15,000.00 or more, as measured for 
the cumulative valuation of permits 

mqu(rements 

8 Dedication 
. .. .. 

are compli 

of Street Rig 
. . .  

overany five(5)yearperiod, thiowner 
of the lot shall makea formal and irre- 
vocable offer of dedication to the City 
for public street purposes, and all uses 
appurtenant thereto, of a depth equal 
to one-half of the width of the street(s) 
described in the resolution. It shall be 
the reponsibill of the City Engineer 
to confirm x a t  the required 
dedication(s)has/have been provided. 

106.4.5.4 Setbacks: 
The required setback shall be main- 

tained for all buildin s structuresand 
improvements, incP;uhing off-street 
parking, as measured from the right- 
of-way width. It shall be the responsi- 
bility of the Building Official to con- 
firm that the required setbacks have 
been provided, based on property 
monuments established by a licensed 
surveyor. 

E. Section 108 of the Uniform Build- 
in code is amended as follows: 

i n  inspection may be refused if: 
108.4.1 The project address is not 

cons icuously posted on site. 
1084.2 A trash container or enclo- 

surecapableof retaining debris associ- 
ated w ~ t h  construction process is not 
available on site, or an existing con- 
tainerisnot regularly emptied ormain- 
taint-d. 

-11BBB911' P ~ ~ t a r y - f a c i f i t i e s  
aregot located within reasonablewalk- 
ingdistanceof thesite (75 yards). There 
shall be not less than one approved 

e of water closet for each hventy 8) employees or a fractional part 
thereof, at start of construction. 

F. Permit Fees, Table I-A is hereby 
deleted., 

G. Section 109 Certificate of Occu- 
Dancv, of the Uniform Building Code 
is amended as follows: 

109.1 No building hereafter erected, 
moved, enlar ed or altered shall be 
occupied, use% or chan ed in use until 
after final inswction ofsuch buildine 
has been per{ormed and a ~ertificat; 
of Occupancy shall have been'applied 
for coincident with the aovlicatlon for 
a buililing permit. " 
, 109.1.1 A Certificate of Occu an 
shall be issued only after such puily 
in& enlargement oialteration has been 
completed inconformi w ~ t h  thepro- 
visionsof thisand allotXercodesand/ 
or required conditions established by 
the C~ty. 

109.1.2 The exception will be those 
buildings given prior administrative 
approval to be erected and used as 
models of typical construction in con- 
formity with 109.1 above. Upon ad- 
ministrative ap roval utilities could 
be established. h e  r uired Certifi- 
cate of Occupancy w% be deferred 
until such time as a re uest for perma- 
nent occupancy is male. 

109.1.3 Any use legall occupying 
an existing building at tKe time this 
code becomeseffechve may becontin- 
ued but shall not be changed unless a 
Certificate of Occupancy for the new 
useshall havebeen lssued by the Build- 
ing Division, pending revlew by the 
Cornmuni Develo ment Department 
and after xndin tEat such use con- 
forms to this an3  all other applicable 
codes or r uired conditions. 

H. ~ u a 3 r a i l  - Section 509.1 is 
amended as follows: 

Man-made changes in grade such as 
retaining walls, garden walls, abru t 
changes in elevation in excess of % 
inches, sloped grades in excess of one (1) 
foot vertical to two feet horizontal, or 
other gradient conditions, which in the 
opinion of City Health and Safe Offi- 
nals, may constitute potential Xazard 
should they be left accessible to the u b  
lic. shall be rotected by a suitabl- Lo- 
or guardmi, meeting th- hei, 
spacing requirements as noted 
form Buildlng Code Table 16-8. 

Exceptions to the above: 
509.1.1 Landscape or garden terra&& 

rendered non-accessible to the a publlc 
by the means of existin perimeter fenc- 
mg or when protected gy the landrape 
elements (Example; hed rows). 

509.1.2Topogra h i c z r ~ e o g r a ~ h i -  
cal conditions inEerent to the nrn- 

erty, lying outside that area nc 
fr uented by individuals. 

X c t i o n  2311.7Tmss Coniiei 
added as follows: 

Truss connection to plate shall be 
made by the use of a visible mechani- 
cal connector designed expressly for 
that purpose satis d l  loadirig 
r2qurrernents. Stan?$$ mof rafters 
fowd inconvrn tiovlconntt--:tionshall 

-=lc m , * ~ Z f  .fT, I t M i l f ~ . '  Add 
Section 1r01.3 a!! Follows: 

1101.3 Maintenance. All buildings, 
struc!ures, and sites, both existing and 
new, and all parts thereof, including 

arkir.. . facilrties and e ui ment for 
k e  ph;51 ~ l l y  disabled, A a i b e  main- 
tained in a safe, functionally effective 
and sanitary condition. All devices or 
safeguards which are r uired b this 
code shall be maintain3 in conrorm- 
ance with the Code Edition, State, or 
Federal Re lationsunder which they 
were instaEd. 

Regradin repaving,replacement of 
si a e angd/or restriping of physi- 
c a y  iisabled parking spaces in ark 
ingYots and structures in both puglicli 
and privately funded public or com- 
merc~al facilities shall comply with the 
State of California Code of Re ula 
tions of the California Building 8ode 
adopted on July 19,1989. 

L. Section 1924 Wire Mesh - Floor 
Slab, of the uniform Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

The minimum thickness of concrete 
floors and slabs supported direct1 on 
theground shall benot less than3 7/2" 
(89 mm). 

Where concrete slab floor on grade 
construction is used and slabs are not 
poured monolithic with footin s there 
shall be placed vertical1 in alp rim- 
eter footings three eigzts (3 /g inch  
deformed steel reinforcingbars, spaced 
four (4) feet center to center. The bars 
shall be wired in place at time of foun- 
dation inspection, not wet set in con- 
p t i o n  with the concrete pour. Said 

ars shall be bent inward and tied to 
the six by six - ten/ ten (10/10) wire 
meshslab reinforcing prior to ouring 
the slab. Vapor barr~ers shalrnot ex- 
tend over the bearing surface of the 
p i m e t e r  footingsorstem wall. When 

oor slabs and footin are oured 
monolithic, the three e i h t s  ( 3 h )  inch 
diameter vertical reinforcing may be 
omitted. All buildingslabsshall havea 
minimum six by six (6 x 6) - ten/ten 
(10/10) wire mesh reinforcing. Fill 
material in trenches and under slabs 
shall be sand unless native material is 
approved by the Buildinb Offjcial. , 

M. Section 1806.5 ootlngs ts 
amended as follows: 

1806.5.1 All continuous concrete or 
masonry foundations shall be rein- 
forced withnot less than twoj2)each- 
Number four (4) reinforcin 

1806.5.2 Any footin or I1 
obtaining a height of 38"or 
be re uired to have addit 

Y 

zonta? reinforcin 
1 -  

1806.5.3 There g a l l  be no stackingof 
ncrete for iers or stem walls. All 
!m walls sRall be formed on both 
les (inside and out). 
1806.5.4 any anchora e other than 

standard foundation bois required by 
buildin design or calculation shall be 
secur&n place at the time of founda- 
tion inspection. 

N. Section 1507.12 Wood Shakes, iq 
amended as follows: 

Installation of wood shin les or 
akes, chemically treated to%e fire 
tardant, when used in newconstruc- 
In, or when re-roofing, sha 

rnat installation criteria as out!~Z%. 
Uniform Buildin Code Section 
1504,l.l and 1504.53 

0 .  Section 304.7 is amended as fol- 
Inwe. 

be attached in thesame mamer.Tru%w 
in excessof35 feet shall be ridge blcxkd 
to eliminate the deflechon or bendine 
which would effect loadin 

" 

JSection708.2.1 ~ i r e a n h r a f t ~ t o p s ,  
is amended as follows: 

708.2.1 Fire Sto s, where re~uired; 
Fire stopping shalrbe provide In the 
followinr locations: 

(5) In 0-pnings around vents;pipes; 
ducts, ch~mneys, fireplaces an slml 
lar openings which afford a passa e 
for fire at ceiling and floor levels, wi?h 
noncombustible materials. In addition 
to those requirements outlined undefl 
thissection, wood burning appliances 
shall be provided with a one-hour fire' 
ratedcha~asurrounding the'flue, when 
such appliances penetrate any part of 
the athc soace. 

g bars. 
stem wal 

' more mz 
ional hori 

.- ..-. 
Group BOccupancies. Anautomatic 

sprinkler svstem shall be Installed in 
all structu&sclassed as Group Boccu- 

ancies where the floor area exceeds 
uare feet on all floors or in 

~ r o u ~ o c c u ~ a n c i e s  3stories or more. 
The area of mezzanines shall be in- 
cluded in determining the area where 
sprinklers are required. This require- 
ment shall not preclude the installa- 
tion of any separation walls required 
by othersectionsof the Burlding Code. 

P. Section 904.2.1, Fire Extinguish- 
,in& !$stems, Where Requir 

ew Construction: 
Unlessrequired by theUni I- 

ing code for a lesser square 6 d 
automatics rinkler system 
stalled in alrstructures wherr ulr Ivrdi 
floor area exceeds 5000 square feet. The 
area of mezzanines, and additional st* 
ries above the ground floor, shall be 
included in determinin he areas where 
sprinklers are requirefi. This 
ment shall not preclude the insg%z 
ofanyseprationwsll~, requindbyother 
sections of the Buildinc o d e .  

red. - 

%ci?ption: GrbtijpR~bivisibn%afid 
Ill Occu ancies, unless re uired by 
Section 7003.2 of the LJniTorm Fire 
Code. 

The square footage of a building shall 
be computed using a combinat~on of 
both usable and unusable floor area. 
Vent shafts and concealed spaces shall 
be considered when computing build- 
in area. Ares of buildings may not be 
reiuced, subdivided, or com artmen- 
talized into areas less than 506b square 
feet bvtheinstallationofseparationwalls. 
~ourkmeehng the requiiementsofsec- 
tion 503.3 of the Uniform BurldineCode 
shallnot be included in the calcuration. 

Plans for Fire Sprinkler systemsshall 
be submitted for review rior to in- 
spection of the structural Kame. 

11. Existing construction: 
An automatic fire sprinkler s stem 

shall be installed in all rooms or zuild- 
ings, when the following conditions 
are determined to exist: 

1. In conjunction with any change in 
the occupancy roup assi ed the 
structure under t i e  ~niformquildin 
Code. and the floor area exceeds 5008 

uaie feet. "9. The area of mezzanines shall be 
included indeterminine theareaswhere 
sprinklers are requires. This 
ment shall not preclude the  ins^^^ 
of any separation walls 
&om of the Buildin?;? 

3. The square footage of a buildin 
shall be computed using inside wa8 
areas.Vent shaftsand concealedspaces 
shall be considered when computing 
building area. Areas of buildings may 
not be reduced, subdivided or corn- 

artmentalized into areas less than 
go00 square feet b the installation of 
separation walls. eourts meetin the 
requirements of Section 404 of the 
Uniform Building Codes shall not be 
included in the calculation. 

111. Historical Structures: 
The title "Historical Shubure" shall 

refer to those structures officially listed 
in the State Historical Register or the 
local historical inventory on file in the 
Community Dwelopment De arhnent. 

The requirements to instalran auto- 
matic fire sprinkler s stem in an His- 
torical Stmctirre shaK be the same as 
those for an existing structure, except 
for the following provisions: 

Special condit~ons associated with 
Historical Structures: 

1. Recommendations for the lace 
ment of backflow devices a n 8  Fire 
Department connections on the exte- 
rior of a Historical Structure, shall be 
made by theFire Department.TheFire 
Department's recommendations shall 
be sub'ect to review by the City Plan- 
ning division, and the Development 
Review Committee. 

2. Exterior devices shall be installed in 
a manner as to orevent disruption of.the 
historical aest6etics of the shcture. 

3. Unless rendered impossible by 
structural components, sprinkler pip- 
ingshallbe installed withinattic 'Sms, 
w ~ t h  thc risers stubbed into t a b i t -  
able arca. In all cases, thesystemhall 
br dwiz-ed and installed in a manner 
as to prevent disruption of any histori- 
cal facades or architecture. 
. .a. Section 904.2.3.3, Exhibition and 
Display Rooms, is hereb deleted. 

R. Section 3103, ~ o v e c r a n d  Tempo- 
rary Buildings, is amended as follows: 

3103.1 Buildings of Structures moved 
!into, reviously existing within, or hs- 
sembred within the jurisdiction shall 
complywith theprovisionsof thiscode 
for new buildinis or structures. 
3103.2Tem~orarvbuild1nesorshuc- 

hues such reviewing srands and 
other miscellaneous structures, sheds, 
canopies, private aircraft hangers less 
than 900 s uare feet in net area, or 
fences um.? for the protection of the 
publicaround and in con'unction with 
construction work may i e  erected by 
approvalof a buildingpermit from the 
Bulldin Official that IS valid for only 
a l imit3 period of time. Said limited 
time period is to be ninety (90) days. 
Any extensions of that time period 
mustbe approved b City Council. All 
otherbuildln sshalrbe termedas" 
manent" bufidin and r e q u i r e r k  
meet all applicabf?codes. 



m9.4 Wheii required, secondary 
meansof access or apparatus roadsnot 
covered by Section 2, sub-section 
902.2.1 through 902.2.3 above, shall be 
developed and maintained per those 
s ecifications as established under 8 .  nrform Fire Code Section 902.2.2.1 
throu h 902.2.2.6. 

9025.2.6 any exceptions to this 0rdi- 
nancewill require thesubmittal ofsuch 
improvement drawings and cross sec- 
tions as necessary for the a pmval by 
the Director of Public w o r k  and the 
Fire Chief. 

B. Section 901, Fire Deparhnent Ac- 
cess and Water Supply. 

Section 901.4.4 1s amer 
lows: 

901.4.4 Premises Identil 
proved numbers of add-, ..,,., , 
placed on all new buildin in such a 
position as to be plain1 visRle and leg- 
lble fromsheetorroad Ltingtheprop 
erty. Said numbers shall contrast with 
theirbackground.Thecharactersshould 
be minimum of 4 inches hi h with 1/2 
inch stroke for single-fami$ residence 
and minimumof61ncheshigh witha3/ 
4 inch stroke for all other occupancies. 

When the buildingorgroupofbuiId- 
. ings (five units or more) is served by 

an alley of interior driveway, the num- 
bers or alphabetical designation shall 
be displayed on a directo or annun- 
ciator board, a proved TY the Fire 
Chief, at each ckveway or alley en- 
trance. Senior Housin Retirement 
Villas, Hotel and ~OteTannunciator 
boards shall be of a Graphic type. The 
p~operty owner, Homeowner's Asso- 
clatton or individual in char e of the 
property shall be responsible k r  main- 
tain~n the directo . 

C. A~TICLE 10, Xre RO 
+em and E uipment. 

Section 1 k l . l  isamenda,, .,..,,,. 
1001.1.1 Type Required. The chief 

shall designate the typeand number of 
fireap liances tobe~mtalled and main- 
l a i n J i n  and upon all buildings and 
premises in the jurisdiction other than 
private dwellings. This shall be done 
accordin to the relative severity of 
pmbable!re.includingtherapiditywith 
which it may spread. Such ap l~ances 
shall be of a su~table for tRe prob- 
able class o f E  askiated with such 
building or premises and shall have ap- 
proval of the chief. Portable fire extin- 

f? ishers shall be in accordance with 
F.C.Standard No. 101.Theminimum 

fire extinguisher requirement shall be 
one (1) 2AlOBC fire extinguisher forev- 
e 75' of floor travel. 
Tection 1003.2, Required Installa- 

tions. 
1. New Construction: 
1. Unless re uired by tl 

~uilding ~ o d e q o r  a lesser r 

I 5. Occupancies within Industrial or 
Manufacturing Zones, when the type 
of tenant is not known at the time of 
construction, shall have the sprinkler 
system hydraulically designed to a 
minimum standard N.F.P.A. hazard 
grou ,asdetermined by theFireChief. 

n. &xisting Construction: 
An automatic fire sprinkler s stem 

shall be installed in all rooms or guild- 
ings, when the following conditions 
are determined to exist: 

1. In conjunction with any change in 

TempoCy s h c t u &  n e d  no com- 
ly w ~ t h  the type of construction or 

Kre-resistive time required by 
this code. Temporary buildings or 
structuresshall becom letely removed 
upon the expiration o8he  time period 
specified in the permit. Failure to re- 
move the buildings or structures will 
result in abatement proceedings and 
misdemeanor citation as prescribed 
under Municipal Code. 

(Ord. 550 1988) 
S. Section 3206 Awnings, of the Uni- 

form Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

3206.2 Awnin construction. 
Awnin sshall%avenon-combustible 

frames. tfwning frames may be ri id, 
except when in the opinion of the Eire 
Chief,emergen accesstoupperfloors 
will be i m p e d s b y  the insta lat~on of 
rigid frame awnin s. Should this be 
the case, awnings stall be colla sible, 
retractable or ca able of being Folded 
against the faceorthe supporting build- 
in . When collapsed, retracted or 
fohed, the desigp shall be such that 
theawningdoesnotblockany required 
exit. 

Coverings for all exterior awnin s 
connected oradjacent to buildingsh51 
be made either from fabric that has 
been made flame-resistent through 
treatment with an approved exterior 
chemical process by an approved aD- 
~lication concern, or from inherently 

ame-resistance fabric ap roved and 
listed by the State Fire Rarsha~ for 
exterior use. Certificates of flame-re- 
sistance or other documentation ac- 
ceptable to the Chief shall be available 
on the premises (Exception: Single- 
family and small two- arn~ly dwell- 
in not exceeding 2 stories in height). 

?Appendix~hapter31, isamended 
as follows: 

3116.1 A patio when enclosed 

i0%.l,1 All automatic sprinkler 
system&all be supervised by an ap- 
proved central, pro rietarv or remote 
stahon service or a yocal i 
will ive an audible sigr 
stantfy attended location. 

Exceptions: 
1. Isolated specialty systems sucn as 

paint spray booth or other small sys- 
tems as a ptoved by the Fire Ch~ef, 
unless tRe entire occupancy is 
e uipped with and automatic sprin- 
k?er system. 

2. Residential sprinkler 
sin le family dwellings, 1 
tri qexes under 5.000 s u 

gction 1006.2.1.1 an3 i 
added as follows: 

1006.2.1.1 Prior to the installahon or 

alarm which 
131 at a con- 

the occupancy roup assi ned- the 
structure under t i e  ~niform%uildln 
Code, and the flmr area exceeds 500f 

rded as fol- 

ication. A 
nc- .?,.*I1 It 

systems for 
duplexes, or 
are feet. 
006.2.1.2 are 

square feet. 
2. The area of mezzanines shall be 

included in determining the areas 
where sprinklers are required. This 
re uirement shall not preclude the in- 
sthation of any separation walls re- 
quired by other sections of the Build- 
in Code. g. The square footage of a buildin 
shall be computed using inside wah 
area. Vent shafts and concealed spaces 
shall be considered when computing 
building area. Areas of buildings may 
not be reduced, subdivided, or com- 
partmentalized into areas less than 
5000 square feet b the installation of 
separation walls. courts meetin the 
requirements of Section 404 of the 
Un~form Building Codes shall not be 
included in the calculation. 

any new hood extin uishing s stem, 
the contractor will su%mit the prans of 
the ro osed installations to the Paso 
~ o b r e s  %ire Department for approval. 

1006.22.2 Plans need not be sophis- 
ticated En ineer'sdrawings. However 
they shcll %e proportional, and contain 
an approximate line drawing of the 
systern. The information required to 
be included on such drawings shall 
include: . 

1. Make an( 
2 Site local 

chemical us- 
3. Size of hc 
4. Number, ty  axlu t-auurl ur ar- 

pliances c o v e r e r  
5. Number, tvw and 

i model of tl 
tion system 
i. 

ie  s stem 
an8type.of 

Ill. Htstor~cal Structures: 
The title"Historical Structure"shall 

referto thosestructuresofficially listed 
in the State Historical Register or the 
local historical inventory on file in the 
Community Development Depart- 
ment. 

The requirements to install an auto- 
matic fire sprinkler s stem in an His- 
torical Structure shaKbe the same as 
those for an existing structure, except 
for the followin provisions: 
A.Specialcon%itionsassociated with 

Historical Structure: 
Recommendations for the placement 

of backflow devices and Fire Depart- 
ment connections on the exterior of a 
Historical Structure, shall be made by 
the Fire Department. The Fire 
Department's recommendations shall 
be sub'ect to review by the City Plan- 
ner and the Architectural ReviewCom- 
mittee. 

2. Exte alled 
in a man1 on of 
the histc tmc- 
ture. 

3. Unless rendered impossible by 

location of 

I of heat de- 

- ,. 
nozzles. 

6. Number and locatior 
tectors. 

7. Location and length of run of p i p  
in ' and conduit 

g.~vw,sizeandlocationofaasshut- 
ltection Sys- 

a .a f.-.lln..... 
off va'lbe; - 

Plans are not required for modifica- 
tion of an existing system, provided that 
the modification is complete, a descrip 
tion of the modification will be subm~t- 
ted with the certification inswction. 

through the i e  of insect screening or 
plastic which is readily removable,not 
exceedine0.125 inch in thickness,shall 
be assum>d to become an addition to 
the existing structure. 

3116.2 As an addition to the struc- 
ture it shall adhere to those setback 
requirements as established by the 
currently adopted zonin regulations 
as they may pertain to t fe  particular 
use, typeofconstruction,orestablished 

Upon completion of installation of a 
new system, a systems test is required. 
7re test shall be that which is com- 
monly referred to as a "Balloon Test", 
or that which is recommended b the 
s stem manufacturer if a " ~ a i o o n  
't", is not feasible. In any case, the 
test shall check the operation of the 
manual pull station, ~f installed, the 
mechanical neumatic or electric en- 
ergy shut-oPf valve, and the piping, 
distribution, and nozzle 

D.Section 1 1 0 1 . 1 . 1 , B u i l ~ ~ g ' ~ P r o p  
er Damaged by Fire. 

X e  owner, occupant or other per- 
son having under their control any 

or materials on proper el- 
rh',"!b'be;z6arding up all openings, znc, 
in& barricading or other ap ropriate 
measures as directed by the Ere Chief 
within 48 hours of the ~ncident. 

Within thirty (30) days after writ& 
notice to do so has been served, all 
debrisand/ordamaged materials shall 
be removed from the property of proof 
furnished that contractual arrange- 
ments havebeen made for demolition. 
replacement or repair of all fire dam- 
aged structuresremainingon the Prop- 

'% involved in the fire. 
ction 1203 add sectic 

shall be inst 
rentdisrupti 
tics of the s 

riot devices 
ier as to pret 
~rical aesthe 

zonii ' 
r 581 N.S. (part), 1989: Ord. 550 ( 0  8: 

N.S.,1988;Ord.546N.s.;Ord.538N.S 
1,1987; Ord. 525 N.S. 5 1,1987; O r 2  
515 N.S. 5 2,1986) 

170.04.030 CHANGES OR ADDI- 
TIONS TO THE UNIFORM FIRE 
CODE 

ARTICLE 2. Definitions and Abbre- 
viation. 

Section2044, isamended as follows: 
'Confined Area" shall mean an 

area bordered orsurrounded by a wall 
fence, planter, landscaping, or eogra- 
phythatwouldrequire theclim%ingor 
scalin of such to reach a public way. 

A R ~ I C L E  9, Fire Departme 
ccna and Water Su ply 

A. Section 902, J r e  ipparat 
cess Roads. 

Uniform Fire Code Section 9 
emended as follows: 

902.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus 
madsshall bedesigned and maintained 
to support the irn osed loads of fire 
apparatus and sha! be provided with 
a surface so as to provide all-weather 
driving ca abilities. During the con- 
struction pxase, this surface shall con- 
sist of base material with sufficient 
depth tosu ort a 40,000 Ib. vehicle (a 
maintaine&fepth of 6 inches of Class 
n base). 

902.2.2Surface. Fire apparatus roads 
shall be designed and maintained to 
support the imposed loads of fire ap- 
paratus and shall be provided with a 
surface so as to provide all-weather 
capabilities. Durin the construction 
phase, thissurfacestall consist of base 
material with sufficient depth to s u p  
port a 40,000 Ib. vehicle (a maintained 
de th of 6 inches of Class I1 base). 

802.2.3 Prior to occupancy, a fire ap- 
paratus road shall be made to conform 
to the r uirements contained within 
the ~ i t y x n i n g  Codes. 

structural components, sprinkler pip- 
inkshall beinstalled withmattic s aces, 
w ~ t h  the risers stubbed Into theEabit- 

ie Uniform 
iquare foot- 
.I-- "..-.-- 

able area. In all cases, the system shall 
be desiened and installed in a manner 
as topr&entdisruptionofany histori- 
cal facades or arch~tecture. 

Section 1003.2.9 is added as follows: 
1003.2.9.1 is added as follows: 
1003.29.1 All Occupancies. An auto- 

matic sprinkler s stem shall be in- 
stalled In all b u i d n  s, regardless of 
occu ancy, in the folkwing instance: 

~ l r n e w  buildings or structures 
thirty-two (32) feet above grade (as 
measured from the adjacent natural 
~ d e  to the roof edge). In no case, 
s all any structure intended for hu- 
man habitation exceed thirty-two (32) 
in height, until such time as suppres- 
sion equipment designed for he~ghts 
inexcessof thir two (32) feet isavail- 
able to the Fire?kpartment. 

Exce~tion: 

a e, an-automatic  prink.^. Jy31c l r l  

skallbeinstalledinallstructureswhere 
the total combination of both usable 
and unusable floor area exceeds 5000 
square feet. The area of.m@zanines, 
and add~tional  stories above the 

ound floor, shall be included in de- 
rmining the areas where sprinklers 
r required. This requirement shall 
t preclude the installat~on of any 
paration wallsrequired by othersec- 

nons of the Buildin Code 
Exception: ~ r o u ~ 5  - ~ i v  

III Occu ancies, unless rc 
Section f003.2.2 of the Ur 
Code. 

2. The square footage of a bulldlng 
shall be computed using a combina- 
tion of both usable and unusable floor 
area. Vent shafts and concealed spaces 
shall be considered when computing 
building area. Areas of buildings may 
not be reduced, subdivided, or com- 

artmentalized into areas less than 
~ O O O  square feet b the installation of 
separation walls. courts meetin the 
requirements of Section 503.3 of the 
Uniform Building Codes shall not be 
included in the calculation. 

3. Plans for Fire Sprinkler systems 
shall be submitted for review prior to 
inspection of the structural frame. 

4. Occupanc~es within Commercial 
zones, in which the type of tenant is 
not known at the time of building per- 
mit (Shell Buildin s), shall have the 
sprinkler system $lydraulically de- 
SI ned to a minimum standard of 
&.P.A. ~ 1 3  ordinary Hazard Group 
In. 

nt Ac- gr 
te 

US Ac- arc 
no 

02.2 in ??I 
isions l and 

uired by 
r3orm Fire 

. .. .. 
follows: 

1203.1 Walkwa s. Walkwa s lead- 
ing horn requirJexits to p u l ~ i c  way 
hall be provided with an all-weather 
urface not less than 36 inches wide 
nd havea clearheight of not less than ~ x i s h n ~  buildings which exceet 

32foot he~ght limitation,may incc ;;in (7) feet. - 
E. Article 11, General Provisions for 

Division is added to the Cr%EfX;e code as follows: 
ARTICLE 11. General F~re-safety 

rate use ofareas above thirty-twc 
foot height limitation, may incor 
rate use of areas above thirty-two gi 
feet,for human habitation,m rovided 
they meet orexceed all applica%lecodes 
adopted by the City, which may per- 
tain tothe typeofconstructionorglven 
use proposed. The City's Fire De art 
ment and Building D~vision shayl b; 
responsibk for the review of thestruc- 
ture, and an related construction 
drawin s to Jetermine their compli- 
ance w i k  theapplicable codes adopted 
by the City. 

Section 1003.3.1 is amended as fol- 
lows: 

Precautions. 
Division V. Ignition Sources 
Section 1112.1, Fire-retardant roof 

coverings. 
Fire -retardant roof coverin s as de- 

fired undersection 1507.12ohhe uni- 
form Building code shall be installed 
on all newly construction buildings 
and upon re-roofing. 



-WWrdd@%1WaTTBwk 
FireResist~veConstruct~on. All exte- 

rior awn11 gs connyted or adjacent to 
bulldlngs .hall be made e~ther from 
fabrlc which has been made flame- 
resistant through treatment with an 
a ~ ~ r o v e d  exterlor chemical Drocess bv 
a;l'approved ap lication 6oncern o'r 
from inherently lame-resistant fabric 
,itpproved and listed by the State Fire 

arshall for exterior use. Certificates 
1 of flame resistant or other documenta- 
tion acceptable to the chief shall be 
available on the premises. 

1 Exception: sin le famil] 
two-famil dwelyings not 
stories in le i  ht 

Section 7905.3:2 is amended by add- 
in the following: 

filans shall be submittet 
application for a permit tc 
than 110 allonsof liquids 11,  u t  ~ 1 1 1 3  VI 

tanks. d e  plans shall indicate the 
methods of stora e, quantities to be 
stored, distances %om buildings and 
property lines, access ways, fire pro- 
tect~on facilities and provisions for 
drainage and runoff. Storage shall be 
in accordance with a 

Section 7902.2.2.1, ' ; P d ~ ~ ~ ~ e S ' Z a -  
tions, is amended as follows: 

Section 79.501. The storage of class I 
and Class II liquids in above-ground 
tanks outside of buildings is 
ited within the limits establisEh'bbi 
law as the limits of district in which 

/ and small 
exceeding 2 
. .. . .  

d with each 
) Store more 
:-,I -..- " A -  

such storage is prohibited. 
Storaeeof flammableorcombustible 

liquidsUin above-ground tanks, stor- 
age of flammable or combustible liq- 
u ~ d s  in outside above-ground tanks 1s 
prohibited in all areas of the City, ex- 
iept those zoning districts wheie the 
use is~ermitted, subiect t o a ~ ~ r o v a l  of 
condiiional usepermit. 

Temporary above-ground storage for 
storage purposes of tract and/or pub- 
lic works projects may be perm~tted 
subject to special permit issued by the 
Fire Marshall. 

F. ARTICLE 10. Fire Protection Sys- 
tems and E uipment. 

Section 1801.4 and 1001.5, Mainte- 
nance and Testing. 

Fire alarm systems shall be main- 
tained and tesied in accordance with 
nationally reco nized standards. 

Fire Alarms skall be tested in an an- 

Fire alarms shall be discernib?; 
throughout any building or structure 
~rotected bv a fire alarm svstem. fire 
iprinklerTitem, fire su piession sys- 
tem or ot er require! installation. 
Alarm svstems shall also comvlv with 
t h ~ s e y i ~ m e n t s s e t  forth un'd6r~itle 
24, Call ornla State Accessibility Stan- 
dards for the Disabled. 

G. PART VIII - Appendices 
The following appendices to the 

Uniform Firecodeare herebv deleted: 
Appendix I-B Life safety'~equire- 

ments for Hi h Rise Buildin s 
Appendix k-c Stairway 18entifica- 

tion 
~ ~ p e n d i r  11-C Marinas 
A endix 11-D Rifle Ran es 
1fg4.040 CHANGES C$R ADDI- 

TIONS TO THE NATIONAL ELEC- - - -  

TRICAL CODE. 
Changesoradditions to theNational 

Electrical Code, referenced to in Sec- 
tion 17.04.010 of this chapter are as 
follows: 

A. All electric services shall have a 
single main disconnect to disconnect 
all conductors In a bullding. 

B. In all new construchon and remod- 
elsinvolvin fifty percent or moreof the 
totalsquareko:oobgeof thebuildin when 
thereauireddiscm-tnect is locatecfjwithin 
the bdilding or in an area not readilv 
accrsible,a;i emergency dlsconnectshafl 
be ~rovided in a readilv accessible loca- 
tio;~ on the exterior of the building as 
designated by the fire chief. The discon- 
nectlngdeviceshall be located withinan 
gproved secunty enclosure (such as a 

ox Box) and a key rovided the fire 
department (Ord. 58fiV.s. art), 1989: 
Ord. 545 N.S., 1988; (3rd. 5P5 N.S. 5 4, 
19%). 

-17.04.050 CHANGS OR ADDT- 
TIONS TO THE UNIFORM PLUMB- 
ING CODE. 

~ha&esor additions to the Uniform 
Plumbing Code referred to in Section 
17.04.010of thischa terare as follows: 

A. Section 608.8of the Uniform 
Plumbin code is amended as follows: 

608.2 Excessive Water Pressure. 
Where local water pressure is in excess 
of ei h (80) pounds per square inch 
(551$kfa), an ap roved type pressure 
regulator preceled by an adequate 
strainershall be installed and the res 
sure reduced toei hty (80) pe; 
square inch (551.&~a) or less. For po- 
table water services u to and inclid- 
ine one and one half (P1/2) inch 138.1 
m k )  regulators, provision shajl be 
made toprevent pressureon the build- 
ing side of the regulator from exceed- 
ing main supply pressure. Approved 
regulators with integral by-passes are 
acceptable. Each such re ulator and 
strainer shall be accessibl Yocated and 
shall have the trainer reaJly accessible 
for cleaning without removing the regu- 
lator or strainer bod or discomectlnk 
thesuppl pi ing. ~ i ~ i ~ e s i z e d e t e r m l -  
nations sKa~;alPbe based on eighty (80) 
percent of the reduced pressure. 

As a result of excessive water pres- 
suresfound within thecity of El Pasode 
Roble -sure ulatdn com lyin 
with d 2  above s n l  be installecfon afi 

lministrativc 

.O, is amend 
- .  

ed as fol- 
. . 

: Author- 

ed as fol- 

newconstn~ction, and on all remodels 
consisting of changes to, or increases of 
the floor space in excess of 50% of the 
existing ~ o s s  uare footage 

B. Sechon 32.4, is amend, 
lows: 

Plumbing trenches under buildings 
or concrete work shall be backfilled 
with sand unless native material is 
approved by Ad 
ity. 

C. Section 411. 
lows: 

Plumbing Fixtures Kequlred. Each 
buildin shall be provided with sani- 
tary faciities of not less than the mini- 
mum facilities listed for various occu- 
.fancies as given in AppendixC, of this 

994 Uniform Plumbin Code. 
(Ord. 581 N.S. (part),q989; 0rd. 515 

N.S. 5 5, 1986) 
This amendment of Munici al Code 

Section 17.01 of the City of ~ P ~ a s o  de 
RoblesentitledanOrdinanceof thecity 
of El Paw de Robles, amending Chap- 
terl7.04of theMunid a1 Code,thcreby 
amendin the1994 &lions of the ~ 1 1 1 -  
form Cofeu, 1993 National Electrical 
Code and specified support codeashall 
su rsededll other ordinanceorparCsof 
orrnance In conflict herewith. 

If any section, subsection, sentence,. 
clause or phrase of theordinance i ~ ,  for 
any reason, held to invalid or uncon- 
stitutional, such decision shall notef- 
fect the validity or constitutionality of 
the remaininfi portions of the ordi- 
nance. The City Council for the City of 
Paso Robles hereb declares that i t  
would have pas& &is ordinance, ahd 
each section, subsection, clause o r  
phrase hereof, irrespective of the fact 
that any one or more sections, subsec- 
tions, sentences, clauses and phrases 
be declared unconstitutional. 

This ordinance and the rules, regula- 
tions, provisions. requirements, orders 
and matters estabhshed herein, are 
hereb adopted and shall takeeffwtand 
be in~l lhrceadef fec t  ~davsefierthe 
dateof its second readin andadoption. 

PASSED AND A W ~ E D  this 19th 
dav of December. 1995 bv the follow. 
in ' roll call vote  YES: Heggal 
Martin, Picanm 

NOES: None 
ABSENT: None 
ABSTAIN: None 
/s/ Walter J. Macklin, Ma 
/s/Richard J. Ramirez, Ci 
Published 1 /3/96 
Legal # 5606CN 


